IET o Blo TeA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

W < A9
CThe Gazette of Iudia

STHTEMUT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT LII—Eusg 4

PART III—Section 4
TR A WehTiyTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

9. 320] ¢ fooel, omar, feaww 10, 2013 /3T 19, 1935
No. 320] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, DECEMBER 10, 2013/AGRAHAYANA 19, 1935
(HRT EIPR Bl SUhH)

g
¢ oo, 16 &R, 2013
g drogdl./fded. /3687172013, —fF deuet (3umpAl w1 3RTwOT T 3HAROn)
FfafaTA, 1970 AR AfFer dFuedr (3ushAt o1 3fAIROT va 3Haver) HAATH, 1980 &I URT 19 o Irh
JearAtoid AGRT 90 g # goid vus Y J6 1 PR Fsd A0y Red & o0 @y weret @
TR FFET WIPR B qd A a1 ATY Ul Uos {Y b (Feany) e Afagda, 1995 # mnaiae
A0 fornfAeafaf@a fafemmeet o & For —
1. (1) zofafaaer dome vz Ry d@ (Fearl) dve (@tye) afagede, 2013 Fensren
(2) TP Toud & gqem g Y AR qod T8 uwg F ST |

2. Uog uus fHY dF (PeimY) dvH 3RATH, 1995 0 3R™TH 50 F 3u-3RAIH (1) FWaed “ar

qu" U= Fuas H ‘v ay¥ " forr sram
(3) uatg wus f{Y do(wean)) e 3fafamer, 1995 @ dffags 50 @0 3u-31fafawe (6) @ asa “a

a¥" Fuas & ‘v a¥” TR Sm|

Fd g TS Ty A

Ot 7. A1), 3U-ARVEGS (ATAT-TaT9 faeprer)

[ forra=-111/4/3TE19R01/134/13 ]

ure fewgor e fafagedd YRd T U993 # i 29.09.1995 & YehIAd fhanaranynadr 380 T
fran e dve Meafof@a g d&ar # Feagar ARG @0 I9aT # garid

fpu aran—
%.4. gz gean et
Q) () €)
1 1/1999 09.09.1999
2 1/2002 22.04.2002

5158 G1/2013 (D



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

(1) 2) 3

3 6/2002 05.12.2002
4 1/2004 05.08.2004
1/2010 28.07.2010
PUNJAB AND SIND BANK
(A Govt. of India Undertaking)
NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 16th November, 2013

No. PSB/PEN/AMEND/1/2013.—In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 19 of
the Banking Companies (Acquisition and Transfer of Undertakings) Act, 1970 and Section 19 of
the Banking Companies (Acquisition and Transfer of Undertakings) Act, 1980, the Board of
Directors of Punjab and Sind Bank after consultation with the Reserve Bank of India and with the
previous sanction of the Central Government, hereby makes the following regulations further to
amend the Punjab & Sind Bank (Employees’) Pension Regulations, 1995, namely :—

1. (1) These regulations may be called Punjab & Sind Bank (Employees’) Pension
(Amendment) Regulations, 2013.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In sub-regulation (1) of regulation 50 of the Punjab & Sind Bank (Employees’) Pension
Regulations, 1995 for the words “two years”, the words “one year” shall be substituted.

3. In regulation 50 of the Punjab & Sind Bank (Employees’) Pension Regulations, 1995, in
sub-regulation (6), for the words “two years”, the words “one year” shall be substituted.

For Punjab & Sind Bank,
P. S. SODHI, Dy. General Manager (HRD)
[ADVT-11I/4/Exty./134/13]

Footnote:—The Principal Regulations were published in the Gazette of India on 29-09-1995 and
subsequent amendments were published in the Gazette of India as under :—

S. No. Notification No. Dated
(D (2 3)
1 1/1999 09-09-1999
2 1/2002 22-04-2002
3 6/2002 05-12-2002
4 1/2004 05-08-2004
5 1/2010 28-07-2010

Ithe Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



